
May 22, 2018

Open Letter

Honorable Minister-President Söder,

On April  19, 2018, Mrs. Gabriele Wittek wrote to you in a
personal letter asking whether the procedures described in the
letter in connection with a wind turbine erected illegally at a
distance  of  50  meters  from  the  Land  of  Peace  of  the
International  Gabriele  Foundations  established  by  Gabriele
Wittek correspond to the Christian values which you publicly
champion.

As you know from our invitation to you on the same day, we,
as  managing  directors  of  the  International  Gabriele
Foundations, are aware of the letter to you. Its receipt has been
certified, but to date you have neither confirmed its receipt nor
have you responded to  its  contents.  Therefore,  we take  the
liberty  of  again  sending  you  the  letter,  addressed  to  you
personally, as an open letter. Surely a broader public will also
take note of this letter with interest, as well as of a possible
answer from you.

As an attachment, we enclose the magazine “DER SPIEGEL”
from May 19, 2018 with the title “The Ghosts of the Vatican –
How Criminals and Saints Created a World Power,” to inform
you about the significance of the so-called Christian values. 



We likewise indicate to you the dogma of the Catholic Church,
quoted from the official textbook  “The Christian Faith,” by
Josef  Neuner  and  Jacques  Dupuis  under  Margin  Note  No.
1005, in which it says:

[The Holy Roman Church, founded by the word of our Lord
and Redeemer,]  firmly believes, professes and preaches that
“no  one  remaining  outside  the  Catholic  Church,  not  only
pagans,” but also Jews, heretics or schismatics, can become
partakers of eternal life, but they will go to the “eternal fire
prepared for the devil and his angels,” unless before the end
of their life they are joined to it (the Church). For union with
the  body  of  the  Church  is  of  so  great  importance  that  the
sacraments  of  the  Church  are  helpful  to  salvation only  for
those remaining in it; and fasts, almsgiving, other works of
piety, and the exercises of a militant Christian life bear eternal
rewards for them alone. “And no one can be saved, no matter
how much alms one has given, even if shedding one’s blood
for the name of Christ, unless one remains in the bosom and
unity of the Catholic Church.”

Sincerely yours,

Ulrich Seifert Martin Kübli

encl.:
Two open letters
Hard copy of cross and wind turbine
“DER SPIEGEL” from May 19, 2018


